Village of Thomaston

From: GLEN ABRAMS <glencosupply@verizon.net>
Sent: Tuesday, September 30, 2025 9:35 AM

To: Village of Thomaston; Mario Mendez
Subject: Quote

Attachments: THOMASTON.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

William,

Here is the revised quote based on current costs. We had a 25% price
increase since April, (tariff wood) but we are eating some of it and we
only increased the quote slightly. Let me know if you have any questions.

All the best!

Click for our NEW Website!

Glen Abrams
President
Glenco Supply Inc.

Glen@Glencosupply.com

800.752.8277
914.262.9960- Cell

732.922.3330- Fax



GLENCO SUPPLY INC. QUOTATION

PO BOX 638

Oakhurst, NJ 07755

800.752.8277
Phone # 800.752.8277 Sales@GlencoSupply.com
Fax # 732.922.3330 www.GlencoSupply.com

9/29/2025 7899

Village of Thomaston
100 East Shore Rd.
Thomaston, NY 11021

30 x 47 x 1.5” Carved Wooden Sign, Single Sided with V Groove routed painted 10 1,975.00 19,750.00
with recessed copy. Price includes painting 2 stock colors custom shape and
crating/

VILLAGE OF THOMASTON GOLD LETTERS WITH GREEN
BACKGROUND.

WE WOULD REQUIRE DIGITAL VECTOR ARTWORK IN COLOR AND
TO SCALE (PDF, Al, EPS)

RECEIVED BY
SEP 8 0 2025

Village of Thomaston

TC'TAL $19.750.00

Thank you for the opportunity to quote you.
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Village of Thomaston

From: dpw

Sent: Tuesday, September 30, 2025 10:45 AM
To: Village of Thomaston

Subject: Fwd: Village of thomaston Quote

Sent from my iPhone
Begin forwarded message:
From: JSIGNS <j@)jsignsinc.com>
Date: September 29, 2025 at 9:33:56 AM EDT

To: dpw <dpw(@villageofthomaston.org>
Subject: Village of thomaston Quote

Attention Benny Mazurkiewicz

Village of Thomaston:

10) single side signs @ 30"H x 47"W x 1" komacel

All letters, borders, and tree: v-carved with 23K gold leaf
Black outline all letters

Dark green background

Total job price for (10) Signs = $19,950.00 ($1,995.00 each)
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; : - Pobllcc Workys
**Pricebasedon?signs Confivmed -Ly PPw Su,aumdud—— ol roellc

**Terms 50% deposit to begin production balance upon customer pick up
**Lead time 5 weeks from approved drawing and deposit

**Prices are customer pick up No Installation

Thank you,



kR, 631-758-0707
J. MORELLO o i@isignsinc.com
Owner/Operator L
J Signs Inc. [@  httpsi/ijsignsinc.com/
[@ 12 Highland Ave., Patchogue NY 11772

0
We would like that you send vector art via email to j@jsignsinc.com Vector art is usually created in Adobe® Illustrator as a
vector based EPS, Al, or PDF file format. If you do not have this type of format, please send the highest resolution file you have
and we will try and convert it to the correct format. If we can, we will take the raster image and convert it to vector. Most of
the time this works, however if your art file is too low resolution to convert, your artwork may need to be redrawn, which may

incur additional charges (depending on the complexity of the artwork). Converting or redrawing artwork may also add additional
days to production.

Vector Files:

Line art, scalable to any size and never loses resolution; image will stay crisp and clean. EPS, AI{CS5 or lower), or PDF. Be sure to
convert all fonts to outlines or curves.



Mineola Signs

255 Mineola Blvd
Mineola, NY 11501-2407
+15167428469
sales@mineolasigns.com
www.mineolasigns.com

Estimate
ADDRESS SHIP TO ESTIMATE # 7926
Village of Thomaston Village of Thomaston DATE 09/29/2025
100 E Shore Rd, Great Neck, 100 E Shore Rd, Great Neck,
NY 11023 NY 11023
ACTIVITY DESCRIPTION Q1Y RATE AMOUNT
SIGN 3’ x 4’ carved PVC signs green with gold painted lettering, 10 1,495.00 14,950.00
per approved art
Pick Up
SUBTOTAL 14,950.00
TAX 0.00
TOTAL $14,950.00
Accepted By Accepted Date
RECEIVED BY
SEP 3 0 202

Village of Thomaston



ira harris
revised estimate

Oct 9, 2025 at 6:12:16 PM
dpw

William Attached is revised estimate. Thank you Ira Harris

/ 0CT 10 2025
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Signs & Printing
32 Cherry Lane
Floral Park, N.Y. 11001

916.771.9241

Website | Online Store
Instagram | Leave Us A Review!

ESTIMATE

DEZANT INC.
32 Cherry Lane, Floral Park, NY 11001, UNITED

STATES
(Signs & Printing) Phone: +1 516-771-9241; dezant5@aol.com:

Website: www.dezantsigns.com

Estimate No#: 0252
Estimate Date: Oct 9, 2025 $26,000.00

ESTIMATED AMOUNT

BILL TO
dpw@villageofthomaston.org



ITEMS & DESCRIPTION

carved sign 3 foot x 4 foot
Sign will have 23kt gold leaf Installation not
included

QTY/HRS PRICE AMOUNT($)
10 $2,600.00 $26,000.00

Subtotal $26,000.00

TOTAL $26,000.00 USD




Villa(_;e of Thomaston

From: Village of Thomaston

Sent: Tuesday, September 30, 2025 3:28 PM
To: Mayor

Subject: Quotes for Village Entrance Signs
Attachments: Entrance Sign Quotes-2025.pdf

Hi Mayor,

Benny asked me to send you the attached 3 quotes for entrance signs to the Village.

Cathy Pultoian

Secretary

Village of Thomaston

Tel-(516) 482-3110
Email-clerk@villageofthomaston.org







